
  

 
 

Pension and Fiduciary (P&F) Service 
 

Fiduciary Quality Call 
Date: May 19, 2022 

TMS: # VA 4626271 

 

AGENDA TOPICS 

 

ITEM 1:  STAR FIDUCIARY QUALITY SFR ANALYSIS 

ITEM 2:  INCORRECT EPs ON NEGLIGENCE DETERMINATIONS 

ITEM 3:  BOND AND FUM CALCULATIONS – ACCOUNTING AUDIT TOOL 

ITEM 4:  QUALITY ACTION PLAN 

CLOSING, QUESTIONS, NEXT QUALITY CALL 

 

AGENDA ITEMS 

Agenda item: STAR Fiduciary Quality SFR Analysis Presenter: Alvin Hill, Analyst 

Target Audience: 

Quality Review Team (QRT) Program Specialists and Coaches/Assistant Coaches 

Discussion: 

A trend analysis was performed on errors cited during the national fiduciary systematic technical 
accuracy reviews (STAR) completed during October 2021 through March 2022. The analysis 
was conducted to identify opportunities for Pension and Fiduciary (P&F) Service to help improve 
national quality. The analysis consisted of reviewing cases with a critical error and the reasons 
for the error. Thirty-nine (39) cases with critical errors were cited during the review period of 
October 2021 to March 2022; 33 were accounting reviews, while the remaining six were from 
field examination reviews. Of the 33 accounting cases, a combined total of 43 individual critical 
errors were cited as a result of multiple critical errors on some cases. 
 
The most common accounting errors cited were A2, C3, C15 and D1 errors. A2 errors are a 
result of missing required elements of a complete accounting and were primarily cited due to 
incomplete or missing bank statements. C3 errors are the result of a failure to obtain a credit 
report during the accounting audit. C15 errors occur when the bond is not verified or a request 
to adjust is completed during the accounting audit. D1 errors are the result of all accounting 
requirements not being met before approval. Overall, 37 percent of the accounting critical errors 
cited were from Indianapolis, 24 percent from Salt Lake City and 15 percent from Louisville. 
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Three hubs committed the six critical errors found during field examination reviews. Although six 
critical errors were found, only one critical error, E8, was cited more than once. E8 errors are a 
result of incorrectly scheduling follow-up field exams too far out. 
 
References/Contacts   

✓ STAR Error Memos 
✓ QMS Reports 
✓ STAR Checklists 

 

 
 

 

Agenda item: Incorrect EPs on Negligence Determinations (NDs) Presenter: Tom Visser, Analyst 

Target Audience: 

Quality Review Team (QRT) Program Specialists and Coaches/Assistant Coaches 

Discussion: 

P&F Service has seen quite a few incorrect end products (EPs) being established by the hubs 
when referring a case to P&F Service for ND completion. Specifically, EP 930s were 
erroneously established rather than the EP 290. The hubs are creating the claim in the wrong 
area of the misuse record. P&F Service is also seeing EP 290s, established outside the misuse 
record, which prevents the EP from linking with the misuse record (visible from the EP Overview 
Page). 

 

References/Contacts   

✓ VBMS User Guide, pages 120-121, 125, and 164   

 

Agenda item: Bond and FUM Calculations Presenter: David Gunnell, 
Analyst 

Target Audience: 

Quality Review Team (QRT) Program Specialists and Coaches/Assistant Coaches 

Discussion: 

P&F Service completed testing the Accounting Audit Tool (AAT) updates that correct the 
recommended bond amount and calculation of funds under management to include other 
income (SSA). The updated AAT was released to the field on May 15, 2022. 
 
References/Contacts   

✓ FPM I.3.C.5.c-f, Review of Investments, Surety Bonds, and 
Administration of VA and Other FUM 

✓ FPM II.2.B.1. and 2., Corporate Surety Bonds 

  

 

https://www.vbms.vba.va.gov/vbmsp2/resources_p4/webhelp/core_webhelp/guides_for_download/vbms_user_guide.pdf
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153957/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-3-Section-C-Audits#5c
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153957/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-3-Section-C-Audits#5c
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153970/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-2-Section-B-Bonds-and-Withdrawal-Agreements#1a
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Agenda item: Quality Action Plan Presenter: Sandy Lundquist, 
Analyst 

Target Audience: 

Quality Review Team (QRT) Program Specialists and Coaches/Assistant Coaches 

Discussion: 

The Fiduciary Advisory Committee (FAC) requested changes to the individual quality reviews 
(IQRs) claim transactions that went into effect on October 1, 2021, for FE, LIE, and FSR 
reviews. A workgroup was established to review the requested changes and create a Review 
Guide similar to those found in M21-4, Chapter 8, Appendix A.b. and B.b.  The workgroup also 
created a step-by-step guide that QRT can use when completing IQR reviews. A recorded 
training session to go over the new guides is scheduled for a June 8th release. Both guides will 
be published in the updated M21-4, Chapter 8 on or about June 15, 2022. 
 
References/Contacts   

✓ M21-4, Chapter 8, Appendix A and B   

Closing Comments 

P&F Service Quality Mailbox: 

We will solicit for agenda topic(s) for each future Quality Call. If you have a specific topic 
suggestion, please feel free to email it to the P&F Service Training, Quality, and Oversight 
mailbox at PFTNGQUALOVRST.VBACO@va.gov. For specific policy and procedures related 
topics, please email to the Policy and Procedures mailbox at PFPOLPROC.VBACO@va.gov. 
 

Quality Call Bulletins 

Quality Call Bulletins can be found in the following location:  
https://vbaw.vba.va.gov/PENSIONANDFIDUCIARY/Quality_Call_Bulletins.asp. The next Quality 
Call is tentatively scheduled for June 2022. 

 

TMS Courses 

All P&F Service Quality Calls and bulletins will be available in TMS.  Once the monthly bulletin is 
finalized, information will be sent to the PMCs and Fiduciary Hubs, which will include the TMS #. 

Post-Call Follow Up 

Quality Call Recording: 

A recording of the May 2022 Fiduciary Quality Call can be found here (open in Chrome):  Watch 
'P&F Service Fiduciary Quality Call - May 2022' | Microsoft Stream 

 
TMS Course: 

Available content from the Quality Call (bulletin, recording, etc.) will be available in TMS.  The 
TMS # for the May 2022 Pension and Fiduciary Quality Call is VA 4626271 (Pension and 
Fiduciary Service Quality Call – Fiduciary May 2022) 

 

https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000127439/Chapter%208.%20%20Fiduciary%20Hub%20(Hub)%20National%20Quality%20Reviews%20and%20Quality%20Review%20Teams%20(QRT)#Appendix%20A.b
mailto:PFTNGQUALOVRST.VBACO@va.gov
mailto:PFPOLPROC.VBACO@va.gov
https://vbaw.vba.va.gov/PENSIONANDFIDUCIARY/Quality_Call_Bulletins.asp
https://web.microsoftstream.com/video/2f34ac39-c731-4df0-afd4-2591b867593e?list=studio
https://web.microsoftstream.com/video/2f34ac39-c731-4df0-afd4-2591b867593e?list=studio
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The link to TMS is HERE.  It is recommended to use Google Chrome when viewing the TMS 
information. 
 

 
 
Q&A: 
 
Question 1:  Columbia Fiduciary Hub 
 
Because the FPM is not clear on if expenses should be included on a SIA for an EIA, the 
recommendation is to include EIA in the FPM I.2.C.4  and to provide clarity to the I.2.C.7.a. for 
more succinct guidance for field examiners to follow when conducting an EIA.  Should hubs 
include expenses for all EIAs routinely?   
 
P&F Service Response: 
 
Yes, fiduciary hubs (hubs) must review and document the beneficiary’s expenses when 
completing an expedited initial appointment (EIA). The hub must review and document all 
financial information during an EIA, with the exception of non-VA assets, as clarified within FPM, 
Part I, 2.C.4.e.  
 
P&F Service is actively researching FPM, Part I, 2.C to determine how EIA documentation 
requirements may be clarified. Please note, if the manual is changed, you will be notified via the 
Compensation Service Calendar email blast. To subscribe to this email blast, please visit the 
Calendar Subscriptions website. 
 
 
Question 2:  Columbia Fiduciary Hub 
 
The FPM II.1.C.4.p. needs to clarify the intention of the reference in regard to the following 
section: receipts, invoices, or copies for any check transaction that cannot be associated with a 
known expense of record, exceed $900.00 or is part of a financial statement in which three or 
more checks were cleared in any single month. 
 
Recommended Solution 
 
Update the reference to clarify whether "and/or" is appropriate after the statement "cannot be 
associated with a known expense of record." 
 
 

https://ssologon.iam.va.gov/CentralLogin/Default.aspx?appname=core&URL=https://ssologon.iam.va.gov/CentralLogin/core/redirect.aspx&TYPE=33619969&REALMOID=06-345d7582-c96e-4888-9e5f-6e86468bf060&GUID=&SMAUTHREASON=0&METHOD=GET&SMAGENTNAME=-SM-JDZx1AxYAhQguyl0rfvd%2f5f46jynE%2bEoBtr6BQQU4NWuWIwCZNPIPHj210fDMxqs&TARGET=-SM-HTTPS%3a%2f%2flogon%2eiam%2eva%2egov%2faffwebservices%2fredirectjsp%2fredirect%2ejsp%3fSPID%3dhttps%3a%2f%2fwww%2esuccessfactors%2ecom%2fVAHCM03%26SMPORTALURL%3dhttps-%3A-%2F-%2Flogon%2eiam%2eva%2egov-%2Faffwebservices-%2Fpublic-%2Fsaml2sso%26SAMLTRANSACTIONID%3d19fffb55--6e66bec2--b05f6f28--93cbcf59--fac6e378--6e
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153950/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-2-Section-C-Initial-Appointments-IA-and-Successor-IA-SIA#4
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153950/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-2-Section-C-Initial-Appointments-IA-and-Successor-IA-SIA#4
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153950/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-2-Section-C-Initial-Appointments-IA-and-Successor-IA-SIA
http://vbacoweb03.dva.va.gov/bl/21/Calendar/cal_Subscribe.asp
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P&F Service Response: 
 
The intent of the referenced guidance in FPM, Part II, 1.C.4.p is to require the fiduciary to submit 
receipts, invoices, or copies of checks for any check transaction that cannot be associated with 
a known expense of record, exceeds $900.00, or is a part of a financial statement in which three 
or more checks were cleared in any single month. It is not necessary for all three of these listed 
conditions to apply to the check transaction. The fiduciary hub (hub) must request receipts, 
invoices, or copies of checks any time one or more of these conditions apply. As such, the FPM 
guidance is correct as written. 
 
 
Question 3:  Columbia Fiduciary Hub 
 
In FPM II.1.C.4.p., it indicates that receipts are needed for any check transaction that exceeds 
$900. The fund usage letter from the repository that is automatically sent out indicates you must 
submit copies of receipts or invoices for large purchases that do not occur on a regular 
basis. FPM II.1.C.4.p also indicates that we do not have to request receipts or invoices for home 
repairs or other large purchases if the most recent field examination projected the purchase. 
 
P&F Service Response: 
 
On May 6, 2022, hubs were notified that the Fund Usage Due Letter and Fund Usage Past Due 
Letter were updated in the Fiduciary Letter Repository to match the FPM requirements for 
submitting verification of check transactions. A request was also made to update this letter in 
VBMS. As the Fund Usage Due Letter is automatically sent from VBMS, it is not necessary for 
the hub to manually send the Fund Usage Due Letter in addition to the automatically generated 
letter. Until the VBMS letter is updated, the hub may, on a case-by-case basis, need to request 
additional information if the fiduciary does not submit the supporting documentation regarding 
check transactions as required per  FPM, Part II, 1.C.4.p.  
 
The fund usage letters also correctly request that the fiduciary submit receipts or invoices for 
larger than normal purchases that do not occur on a regular bases, as required per FPM, Part II, 
1.C.4.q. The Policy & Procedures Team is unable to locate the referenced manual guidance 
stating that the hub is not required to request receipts or invoices for home repairs or other large 
purchases if the most recent field examination projected the purchase. As stated in FPM, Part II, 
1.C.4.p, the fiduciary must submit receipts or invoices for irregular purchases, when needed to 
verify fund usage. If the hub cannot verify fund usage for irregular purchases, further 
documentation must be requested.  
 
 
Question 4:  Columbia Fiduciary Hub 
 
Additionally, does FPM I.3.C.3.c.(k)(l) apply to this rationale for reviewing FURs?  
 
P&F Service Response: 
 
No, FPM, Part I, 3.C.3.c, k, and l do not apply to fund usage reviews. These blocks specifically 
discuss reconciling accountings when the accounting form does not match financial statements. 

https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153966/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-1-Section-C-Issues-Regarding-Beneficiarys-Funds
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153966/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-1-Section-C-Issues-Regarding-Beneficiarys-Funds
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153966/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-1-Section-C-Issues-Regarding-Beneficiarys-Funds
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153966/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-1-Section-C-Issues-Regarding-Beneficiarys-Funds
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153966/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-1-Section-C-Issues-Regarding-Beneficiarys-Funds
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153966/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-1-Section-C-Issues-Regarding-Beneficiarys-Funds
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153957/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-3-Section-C-Audits
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153957/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-3-Section-C-Audits#3k
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153957/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-3-Section-C-Audits#3l
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There is no reporting form submitted by the fiduciary for fund usage reviews. As such, the 
referenced blocks apply to accountings only. 
 
 
Question 5:  Columbia Fiduciary Hub 
 
Will further analysis of information such as addition of telephone calls, additional documentation 
requests, etc…be required by fiduciaries for auditing/review purposes to ensure a full overview 
for fiduciary oversight despite the shorter FUR review period? 
 
P&F Service Response: 
 
Telephone development is already required as part of fund usage review development, per 
FPM, Part II, 1.C.4.g.  P&F Service has no plans to require any additional documentation from 
the fiduciary than what is currently required under FPM, Part II, 1.C.4.p.  
 
 
Question 6:  Columbia Fiduciary Hub 
 
We have reviewed the FPM for a definition related to “non-VA assets” and it does not provide 
detailed information on what the hub personnel should consider.   Also, the FPM refers to liquid 
assets and we are not certain if these words are to be used interchangeably or if an upcoming 
FPM update will provide more clarity.       
 
P&F Service Response: 
 
Yes, fiduciary hubs (hubs) must review and document the beneficiary’s expenses when 
completing an expedited initial appointment (EIA). The hub must review and document all 
financial information during an EIA, with the exception of non-VA assets, as clarified within FPM, 
Part I, 2.C.4.e.  
 
 
Question 7:  Columbia Fiduciary Hub 
 
What constitutes the hub’s requirement to make “reasonable attempts to identify the individual 
or entity entitled to or administering the affairs of the beneficiary’s estate if there is no fiduciary 
in place managing VA FUM in trust at the time of the beneficiary’s death,” as provided in the 
Notes section of FPM II.3.D.3.i, Step 5? 
 
P&F Service Response: 
 
As outlined in FPM, Part II, 3.D.3.i, fiduciary hubs do not need to take further action to locate a 
possible heir if research into VA records has been exhausted and the Death - NOK No Fiduciary 
letter has been sent.   
 
“Reasonable effort” means to review available VBA systems (i.e., VBMS, Share) and extend to 
other VA systems, such as VHA records through CAPRI, if VBA systems do not contain any 
next of kin information.   
 
 

https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153966/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-1-Section-C-Issues-Regarding-Beneficiarys-Funds
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153966/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-1-Section-C-Issues-Regarding-Beneficiarys-Funds
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153950/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-2-Section-C-Initial-Appointments-IA-and-Successor-IA-SIA#4
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153950/FPM-Part-I-Chapter-2-Section-C-Initial-Appointments-IA-and-Successor-IA-SIA#4
https://vaww.vrm.km.va.gov/system/templates/selfservice/va_kanew/help/agent/locale/en-US/portal/554400000001030/content/554400000153975/FPM-Part-II-Chapter-3-Section-D-Reissuance-of-Benefits-and-Negligence-Determinations?query=next%20of%20kin#3i
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Question 8:  Columbia Fiduciary Hub 
 
Does this include utilizing internet, CLEAR, and other resources to identify the individual or 
entity? 
 
P&F Service Response: 
 
No. See response to Question 7. Any additional efforts concerning the estate would be the 
jurisdiction of a probate court. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

                     

 


